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the antichrist 
 

1 John 2:18-23 'Children, it is the last hour. And as you have heard that antichrist is coming, even 
now many antichrists have come. By this we know that it is the last hour. They went out from us, but 
they did not belong to us; for if they had belonged to us, they would have remained with us. 
However, they went out so that it might be made clear that none of them belongs to us. But you 
have an anointing from the Holy One, and all of you know the truth. I have not written to you 
because you don’t know the truth, but because you do know it, and because no lie comes from the 
truth. Who is the liar, if not the one who denies that Jesus is the Christ? This one is the antichrist: the 
one who denies the Father and the Son. No one who denies the Son has the Father; he who 
confesses the Son has the Father as well. '  

2 John 1:7-11 'Many deceivers have gone out into the world; they do not confess the coming of Jesus 
Christ in the flesh. This is the deceiver and the antichrist. Watch yourselves so that you don’t lose 
what we have worked for, but that you may receive a full reward. Anyone who does not remain in 
Christ’s teaching but goes beyond it does not have God. The one who remains in that teaching, this 
one has both the Father and the Son. If anyone comes to you and does not bring this teaching, do not 
receive him into your home, and do not greet him; for the one who greets him shares in his evil 
works. ' 

By September 21, 2022, the world population will have been reduced by 2,000,000,000 people, 
leaving only 6 billion. Precisely the believers were taken home, they were allowed to be taken up by 
faith in Jesus Christ, this was NOT tied to a religion, but by a faith that was in the heart. Despite the 
many differing creeds, these souls have been drawn to God and now they have been taught the 
truth. 

This is what will happen on September 21, 2022 

Daniel 12:11  'From the time the daily sacrifice is abolished and the abomination of desolation is set 
up, there will be 1,290 days. '  

Revelation 13:1 'And I saw a beast coming up out of the sea. It had ten horns and seven heads. On its 
horns were ten crowns, and on its heads were blasphemous names. '  

On this date all believers are taken away and Satan is set up. He comes out of the sea and that will 
result in a very large tsunami. 

This will happen after September 21, 2022 

Revelation 6:12 'Then I saw him open the sixth seal. A violent earthquake occurred; the sun turned 
black like sackcloth made of hair; the entire moon became like blood; '  

This said earthquake will cost the lives of many millions of people, and the impending religious war 
will cause another 2,000,000,000 deaths. that is one third of the current world population. Below 
you will be explained what and how it will take place, you will be told in advance. It is precisely 
because of this that you know what the truth is. 

Revelation 9:14-15  'say to the sixth angel who had the trumpet, “Release the four angels bound at 
the great river Euphrates.” So the four angels who were prepared for the hour, day, month, and year 
were released to kill a third of the human race. '  

  

https://my.bible.com/bible/1713/1JN.2.18-23
https://my.bible.com/bible/1713/2JN.1.7-11
https://my.bible.com/bible/1713/DAN.12.11
https://my.bible.com/bible/1713/REV.13.1
https://my.bible.com/bible/1713/REV.6.12
https://my.bible.com/bible/1713/REV.9.14-15
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Final Struggle - Openly Confessing Christ to the World 

All spiritual things will be declared strife in the last time before the end. By this you will recognize 
what time it is on the world clock that the day is coming to an end. You should then expect great 
excitement generated by rigorous measures of the secular government. You will be cornered with 
questions and threats about your attitude to Christ and about faith in all respects. They will not shy 
away from watching you, listening to your conversations and dragging you before the judiciary, that 
you may answer for your speech and actions. 

And then the time has come when you will have to confess to God openly and speak without fear 
how you think and stand before Him. This open confession before the world, He asks as proof of your 
union with Him. He Himself knows how you think and feel in your heart, but it is a final battle in 
which a separation must take place between the goats and the sheep. And this struggle must be 
fought openly, so that the struggle itself may also be clear, that the guilt of the adversary may be 
clearly visible to the world, in order to spur even those who still hesitate to make a decision, both 
through the conduct of the believers as well as those who are their enemies. The battle will last but a 
short time and it will be waged everywhere, just in different forms. 

Lovelessness will always fight against love, the material world will mock and torment the spiritual 
world, two sides will be clearly seen everywhere. Where the doctrine of Christ has penetrated and 
the divine doctrine of love is the foundation of what men are preached and asked to believe. And 
therefore the apostasy from God will be evident throughout the world, but where the Christian 
doctrine of love is spread, the battle of faith will be fierce, and that will be the end. 

The Religious War Through Matthew Foretells 

Matthew 10:16-28  “Look, I’m sending you out like sheep among wolves. Therefore be as shrewd as 
serpents and as innocent as doves. Beware of them, because they will hand you over to local courts 
and flog you in their synagogues. You will even be brought before governors and kings because of 
me, to bear witness to them and to the Gentiles. But when they hand you over, don’t worry about 
how or what you are to speak. For you will be given what to say at that hour, because it isn’t you 
speaking, but the Spirit of your Father is speaking through you. “Brother will betray brother to 
death, and a father his child. Children will rise up against parents and have them put to death. You 
will be hated by everyone because of my name. But the one who endures to the end will be saved. 
When they persecute you in one town, flee to another. For truly I tell you, you will not have gone 
through the towns of Israel before the Son of Man comes. A disciple is not above his teacher, or a 
slave above his master. It is enough for a disciple to become like his teacher and a slave like his 
master. If they called the head of the house ‘Beelzebul,’ how much more the members of his 
household! “Therefore, don’t be afraid of them, since there is nothing covered that won’t be 
uncovered and nothing hidden that won’t be made known. What I tell you in the dark, speak in the 
light. What you hear in a whisper, proclaim on the housetops. Don’t fear those who kill the body but 
are not able to kill the soul; rather, fear him who is able to destroy both soul and body in hell. '  

The battle of faith is relentless 

The antichrist camouflaged as a bringer of salvation 

This is the spirit of the antichrist, who comes to men under the guise of a salvation-bringer, but 
whose will is yet completely turned away from God in so far as he does not accept a God of love, just 
as he rejects the spiritual as supernatural and therefore unprovable and therefore non-existent. And 
the essence of Christ will also be so strange to him that he will not believe in His work of redemption 
and His mission on earth, and therefore he tries to picture Him as a fantasy figure, and takes every 
precaution to take this Person from the hearts of the people. to displace. His own being does not 
correspond to the being of Christ, so it is understandable that he regards Him as an enemy and thus 
fights it. 

https://my.bible.com/bible/1713/MAT.10.16-28
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The antichrist to be expected is a personality that emerges from the frame of the natural. He is an 
extraordinarily gifted man and his special strength lies in his plan of world order, in his extraordinary 
conduct towards those responsible for the well-being of the people. Therefore, he will achieve great 
success, for he will be bestowed with the supremacy that he is striving for. He is expected to undergo 
profound changes for the benefit of the general, therefore all worldly minded people will hire him 
and he will exploit that privileged position for all sorts of measures. And in particular he will act 
against the spirit of the supernatural, against all religious organizations, as well as against the 
churches or spiritual movements based on Jesus Christ and His teachings. 

For he will present charity as a state of weakness which must be fought in all circumstances. 

Whoever agrees to his pursuit is equally as antichrist and is therefore an opponent of God, he will 
also behave unlovingly towards his neighbor and therefore also continue in spiritual blindness, 
because he belongs to the kingdom of satan. As ruler of many, the antichrist will stir up great 
commotion by his measures, which lack all humanity and only try to foment hatred and discontent 
among the people to stifle love and plunge the people into great spiritual need. 

But then God's response is urgently needed, and this explains the activity of God through His 
servants on earth, because He too must be recognizable on earth for those who belong to His camp. 
He must, therefore, likewise proceed in an extraordinary manner that He may not be rejected, but 
may be acknowledged, if only men are willing to go the right way. If only they consciously or 
unconsciously turn to the Creator of heaven and earth to ask Him for help in spiritual distress. And 
then also the wrestling of good against evil is particularly fierce, for the hour of the end draws nearer 
and nearer and the separation of the spirits must take place until the last day. 

And this separation can take place only when people are seriously presented with the choice to 
acknowledge God or to deny Him. That question will force them to a decision, and to back it up God's 
adversary steps forth openly by influencing his emissaries on earth to take and implement measures 
that betray a godly thinking And so begins the final battle on this earth, the battle of faith, the battle 
against Christ, with the result that people must now definitively speak out: for or against Him. And 
then comes the final judgment, because in free will they now turn to God or away from Him, and 
they must also answer for that free will. 

This battle is inevitable and clearly reveals the essence of the antichrist. Thus all mankind can clearly 
see through the thinking and acting of him who appears under the mask of a savior to carry out his 
abominable plans, who openly fights against God and therefore is bound again for a long time in the 
earth, whence he cannot free himself until the people help him again and by their false love for 
matter loosen the chains of satan again. 

But Jesus Christ will never be supplanted, He will remain victorious at the last day and His teachings 
will fill all loving hearts. His faithful ones will take His teachings of love with them when they are 
taken away, and thus His teachings will also be upheld as spiritual knowledge on the new earth - the 
1000 year reign. It will unfold to the fullest, and through it men will possess the highest knowledge 
and be ignited in the deepest love of God. And by the adversary of God, it can never be supplanted 
again because all power has been taken from him for a long time. 

 


